
There are a number of different forms of communication and one such form is body 
language.
In what way is body language a form of communication?
What other ways do people communicate with each other?

Man has always been trying to socialize since the dawn of time due to its social nature. 
Hence, humans have looked forward to inventing methods to connect with each other 
one of which is body language. Nowadays, due to modern communication devices, 
there are large variety means of connection which lead to the disappearance of the old 
ones. However, body language has not been replaced yet by the other forms even after 
developmenting of technology.

To begin with, there are a great number of methods for getting in touch and, the 
internet has changed the way of socializing to a virtual one which is welcomed by 
people in all ages in terms of bridging the gap between cultures and breaking the 
barriers. Above all, its promptitude and easy access contributed this kind of socializing 
to the most popular one. 

On the other hand, many argue that having face-to-face communication is the most 
proper way of negotiation because the fact is in such connections body reaction to 
words is more obvious than what is being said. Psychologists have proved many a point 
in body gesture with different meanings through a conversation. To exemplify, a certain 
gesture of a person can show you that if/whether the person is interested in you or not. 
In a recent experiment a psychologist illustrated that one is able to show oneself, one's 
emotion namely, being impatient, being in love or being sad to his/her peer only by 
changing the way of looking into the peer’s eyes. Therefore, most employers are eager 
to have a face-to-face interview with their candidates before hiring them( as an 
employee).

To conclude, although there are a variety of communicating ways for people, body 
language is the preferable one, because it is perceived to be is being indicating more 
reliable than other forms of communicating.


